

# **Rainbow's End Metal Detecting Association**

## **Minutes for Meeting**

**June 13, 2018 (Start at 7:40 pm)**

### **Meeting called to order**

- 28 Attendees
- Guest, Kevin, Don & Shaun

### **Minutes of May Meeting**

- Motion to approve by Lenny, seconded by Angelo, all accepted

### **Treasurer Report:**

- All in good standing. Did very well on the hunt proceeds, better than last year and biggest profit came from Joe selling coins.

### **Membership**

- See John if memberships not paid.

### **Other:**

- Joe thanked the club for having the Niagara Relic Hunters at the hunt
- Congratulations to Lenny on winning the 50/50
- Treasurer week is coming up in the States in the next few weeks
- Dave P brought in a donation from Ron K. for auction. There is a reserve bid on some anything over the reserve will be donated to the club.

### **Break: 7:50 pm to 8:10 pm**

### **Other:**

- John S's wife is in the hospital and we hope that she is doing well
- Dave M's road trip has room for 1 more. Going around July 26<sup>th</sup> in the Barrie/Orillia area
- Brenda said we had a really good hunt this year. Brenda needs someone to take over for her role in the hunt and she will transition to someone new. Requires someone who is computer literate. We all are thankful for Brenda's contributions. We are always looking for volunteers for the hunt committee. Ron from the States sent an email to thank us for an awesome time.
- Next year is the 20<sup>th</sup> anniversary of the hunt and plans are underway. Start reaching out to suppliers for donations early.
- Joe C asked is something could be done regarding the cost to get in the park.
- Alex M asked if we could bring forward to the club to add 2 extra codes to the finds board to help new hunters participate. Suggestions to be brought forward and review in our Sep meeting. Suggestions such as oldest coin, foreign coin, toys etc
- Usually every weekend a group of people go hunting. If interested, add your name to the list to be called to let you know the details.
- Lenny was detecting in Mississauga and approached by a park person and advised if we don't fix our holes they will be banning detecting in Mississauga parks. Dave P confirmed in Woodstock people are not fixing their holes. Mark from FMDCA wants to start a mandatory digging

program to ensure it is done properly. 3 part course and train people to be trainers. Janet to find out more information.

**Auction Time:**

- Binoculars - \$11.00
- LED light - \$5.00
- Cooper Nickle - \$3.00
- Scan proof wallet - \$5.00
- 100 quarter holder - \$4.00
- Treasure box - \$3.00
- Hub dog charger - \$3.00
- 1972 Cooper Nickle - \$3.00
- Treasurer box - \$10.00
- US Jefferson 5 cent 1938-1961 47 pieces - \$15.00 - \$7 reserve bid
- US Jefferson 5 cent 1962-1995 – 65 pieces - \$9.00 - \$6 reserve bid
- US Jefferson 5 cent – 24 pieces - \$3.00 – \$3 reserve bid
- US State Quarters – 94 pieces – no bid
- US State Quarters – 86 pieces – no bid
- Cdn/US 5 cent – 56 pieces - \$7.00 - \$6 reserve bid
- Vancouver Biathalon 2010 - \$15 - \$15 reserve bid
- 2005 Bravery – 25 cent - \$18 - \$15 reserve bid
- US Wheat pennies - \$5.00 - \$5.00 reserve bid
- 1867-1992 Cdn 25 cent millennium set - no bid
- 1968 Cdn mint – no bid
- 1983 Cdn mint – no bid
- 1996-2006 Cdn mint – no bid
- 1980 US mint – no bid
- 1999-2000 Cdn stamp/coin set - no bid
- 2009 BU – US 1 cent – no bid
- 2009 BU – US 1 cent – no bid
- 1976 & 1978 Cdn 1 cent and 50 cent - \$2.00 – \$2.00 reserve bid
- 2005 Unc Terry Fox - \$4.50 – reserve bid \$4.50
- 2008 Unc Flying loons – no bid
- Assorted Unc Toonies – no bid
- Set of 7 – US large coin replicas - \$12.00 - \$12 reserve bid

**Finds Board:**

- COIN: 1965 50 cent piece – Dennis J
- GOLD: 10 carat gold ring – Dave M
- SILVER: School ring – Dave M

- RELIC: Tag from UK – Lenny
- COSTUME JEWELRY: Versachi ring – Dan O
- MISC: Red truck - Alex M
- MOST UNUSUAL: Compact – Dave P
- BEST OVERALL FIND FOR THE NIGHT: School Ring – Dave M

**Raffles/Draw**

- 50/50 Prize Winner – Len T
- Case Dollar Prize Winner – Richard S
- Door Prize Winners (50/50 tickets): Paul D, Angelo, Gwen, Robin, Dan O(2), Dan O, Dave M, Gerry

**Meeting Adjourned: 9:20 pm**

**Next Meeting: July 11, 2018 at 7:30 pm**

*Please note: any errors or omissions on these meeting minutes should be reported at the next scheduled meeting. A copy of these minutes will also be posted on the REMDA website along with photos of the Finds Board*